

**BC Timber Sales, Kamloops Business Area
Sales Schedule for April 1, 2008 to March 31, 2009**

TSL Number	# Blocks	Geographic Location	Category	Term (months)	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m ³)	Avg Piece Size (m ³ per tree)	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
CASCADES												
MERRITT												
A74401	2	Pimainus	2	24	No Bid Apr	79	23,355	0.23	PI99, Sx1	CCR	G	MPB
A74401	2	Pimainus	Any	24	Sold - Jun	79	23,355	0.23	PI99, Sx1	CCR	G	MPB
A75794	3	Rabbitt (re-sale)	Any	24	Sold - Jun	69	19,659	0.55	Fd47, PI41, Sx8, BI2, Py2	CCR	G	MPB
A74400	6	Pimainus	Any	24	Sold - Jun	91	28,944	0.20	PI99, Sx1	CCR	G	MPB
A83328	1	Plateau Lake	Any	24	Sold - May	141	48,641	0.28	PI84, Sx14, BI1, Sx1	CCR	G	MPB
A83329	1	Plateau Lake	Any	24	Sold - May	240	75,192	0.48	PI63, S22, Fd11, B4	CCR	G	MPB
A81531	1	Mathew/McPhail Creek	Any	26	No Bid Jul	157	25,187	0.22	PI83, Fd7, S7, BI3	CCR	G	MPB
A79597	1	Rabbitt/Boulder Cr	2	24	No Bid Sep	80	35,331	0.80	F 40 PI 32 S 25	CCR	G	MPB
A82902	10	Ketchan	Any	24	Sold - Oct	302	78,591	0.37	PI78Sx20BI1Fd1	CCR	G	MPB
A84779	1	Pennask Lake	Any	12	Sold - Oct	4	10,500	0.29	PI92Sx8			Decked wood
A76888	5	Quilchena	Any	24	Sold - Nov	166	45,675	0.23	PI 93 S 03 At 02	CCR	G	MPB
A79597	1	Rabbitt Mtn	2	24	Sold - Nov	80	35,331	0.77	F 40 PI 32 S 25	CCR	G	MPB
A79598	1	Rabbitt/Boulder Cr	Any	24	No Bid Oct	265	119,034	0.57	PI 63 S 15 F 15	CCR	G	MPB
A79795	3	Champion Creek	Any	24	No Bid Nov	139	52,652	0.61	PI 39 F 35 S 15	CCR	G	MPB
A79598	1	Rabbitt/Boulder Cr	Any	24	Sold - Dec	265	119,034	0.57	PI 63 S 15 F 15	CCR	G	MPB
A82903	1	Wolfe Belgie North	Any	24	No Bid Dec	48	17,697	0.24	PI77Sx19Fd2BI2	CC	G	MPB
A84404	5	Wolfe Belgie North	Any	30	No Bid Dec	238	86,852	0.34	PI79 Sx19 Fd2 BI2	CCR	G/C	MPB
A82903	1	Wolfe Belgie North	Any	21	Sold - Feb	48	17,696	0.24	PI76 S 19 B 3	CC	G	MPB
A84404	5	Wolfe Belgie North	Any	26	Sold - Feb	238	86,852	0.34	PI79 Sx19 Fd2 BI2	CCR	G/C	MPB
LILLOOET												
A80368	4	Nicoamen	Any	24	No Bid Jun	65	19,413	0.29	PI51, Fd28, BI13, Sx8	CCR	G	MPB
A80961	2	McGillivray	Any	18	No Bid Jun	66	20,002	0.35	PI78,Fd10,S10,BI2	CCR	G/C	MPB
A82374	4	Murray	Any	18	Sold - Jun	51	11,394	0.35	PI80,Fd16,S2,BI2	CCR	G	MPB
A80368	4	Nicoamen	Any	24	Sold - Jul	64	19,413	0.29	PI 58 F 22 B 16	CCR	G	MPB
A80961	2	McGillivray/Medicine Creek	Any	24	Sold - Oct	51	14,355	0.35	PI78,Fd10,S10,BI2	CCR	G/C	MPB
A72877	10	Cadwallader	Any	30	No Bid Nov	111	45,383	0.46	PI52 S32 B16	CC	G/C	MPB
A83033	11	West Pavilion/Upper McKay Ck	Any	30	No Bid Nov	227	75,684	0.29	PI73,Sx21,BI5,Fd1	CC	G/C	MPB
Sub-total for Cascades Field Team						3,364	1,155,222					
CLEARWATER												
A81594	2	Mahood	Any	15	No Bid Apr	71	11,451	0.25	PI(F)	CCR	G	MPB
A83162	1	Mahood (Burn)	Any	24	Sold - Apr	30	18,946	0.47	FPI	CCR	G/C	Burn
A83115	-	Stearns Road	Any	10	Sold - Jun	-	2,670	0.35	F(PI)	CCR	G	Decked wood
A82448	2	Rogers Range	Any	20	Sold - Jul	100	41,625	0.35	PI 67 F 15 C 10	CCR	G	MPB
A83226	1	Tobe Lake	Any	18	Sold - Aug	82	27,839	0.30	PI 85 S 08 B 06	CCR	G	MPB Road Permit
A83338	1	TFL (B105)	Any	17	Sold - Jul	53	14,594	0.25	PI 83 F 07 C 06	CCR	G	MPB
A81594	2	Mahood	Any	15	Sold - Aug	59	11,451	0.26	PI 54 F 25 At 08	CCR	G	MPB
A81592	2	Mahood	Any	18	Sold - Sep	65	19,488	0.32	PI 65 F 26 At 06	CCR	G	MPB
A83658	2	Redsands	Any	27	Sold - Sep	48	20,366	0.81	S 60 B 29 C 09	CCR	G	
A66211	1	Oliver Creek	Any	24	Sold - Aug	36	16,072	1.68	C 72 H 25 S 02	CCR	G	Partition
A83599	5	MacKenzie Ck	Any	16	No Bid Dec	188	38,866	0.34	PI 71 S 21 B 08	CCR	G	MPB
A60233	2	McMurphy	2	16	No Bid Nov	81	30,859	0.41	PI 59 F 24 C 14	CCR	G	MPB
A82111	2	Nehalliston	2	18	Sold - Nov	62	19,241	0.63	PI 58 S 32 B 09	CCR	G	MPB
A84107	3	Tobe Lake (Highway 24)	Any	16	Sold - Dec	136	42,777	0.35	PI 69 S 21 B 08	CCR	G	MPB
A83305	2	Foghorn/Hascheak Creek	Any	12	Sold - Mar	40	8,427	0.44	PI 61 F 14 S 11	CCR	G	MPB
A83599	5	MacKenzie Ck	Any	14	Sold - Feb	188	38,866	0.35	PI 73 S 20 B 07	CCR	G	MPB
Sub-total for Clearwater Field Team						1,238	363,538					

**BC Timber Sales, Kamloops Business Area
Sales Schedule for April 1, 2008 to March 31, 2009**

TSL Number	# Blocks	Geographic Location	Category	Term (months)	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m ³)	Avg Piece Size (m ³ per tree)	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
KAMLOOPS												
A78991	1	Bonaparte Lake	Any	17	Sold - Apr	89	24,221	0.22	PI 92 S 06 B 02	CCR	G	MPB
A79857	3	Lodgepole Lake	2	17	Sold - Apr	104	25,044	0.24	PI 91 S 06 F 02	CCR	G	MPB
A79858	2	Lodgepole Lake	Any	17	Sold - May	146	37,601	0.25	PI 82 S 13 F 05	CCR	G	MPB
A80438	2	Melba Creek	Any	24	Sold - Jun	163	44,299	0.23	PI 93 S 05 B 01	CCR	G	MPB
A80439	2	Melba Creek	Any	24	Sold - Jun	153	37,908	0.24	PI 91 S 06 F 02	CCR	G	MPB
A81703	2	Georges-Roche/Bulman	Any	24	Sold - May	109	37,171	0.33	PI 91 F 05 S 04	CCR	G	MPB
A81704	2	Georges-Roche/Bulman	Any	17	Sold - May	182	61,503	0.23	PI 87 B 09 S 04	CCR	G	MPB
A82315	1	Georges South	2	24	Sold - May	100	38,264	0.31	PI 77 S 17 B 05	CCR	G	MPB
A80931	1	Chartrand/Ware Lake	Any	18	Sold - Sep	144	36,997	0.33	PI 73 S 26 F 01	CCR	G	MPB
A82262	1	East Mow	2	9	No Bid Dec	25	6,780	0.31	PI 91 S 5 B 5	CC	G	MPB
A85189	1	Scottie Creek ITSL	Any	9	Sold - Dec	144	31,023	0.17	PI 100	CCR	G	Fibre Sale Machine Free Zone
A82262	1	East Mow	Any	14	No Bid Feb	25	6,780	0.31	PI 73 S 22 B 05	CCR	G	MPB
A82263	4	East Mow	Any	19	Sold - Feb	172	51,404	0.21	PI 75 S 17 B 07	CCR	G	MPB
A82836	2	Face Paska ITSL	Any	8	No Bid Jan	108	26,246	0.23	PI 80 S 20	CCR	G	MPB
A82836	2	Face Paska ITSL	Any	8	Sold - Jan	108	28,051	0.23	PI 80 S 20	CCR	G	MPB
A85264	2	Face Paska ITSL	Any	20	Sold - Jan	147	40,659	0.22	PI 76 S 22 B 02	CCR	G	MPB
A83169	2	Frogmoore	Any	18	Sold - Mar	214	68,111	0.25	PI 65 B 26 S 09	CCR	G	Decked Wood Machine Free Zone Standard Practice
Sub-total for Kamloops Field Team						2,133	602,062					
100 MILE HOUSE												
A39890	1	Gotchen	Any	31	Sold - Jul	129	53,440	0.81	F 31 S 29 PI 28	CCR	G	spruce beetle
A42512	1	Canimred Creek	Any	24	Sold - Aug	140	29,381	0.37	PI 88 S 09 B 02 At 01	CCR	G	MPB
A51947	2	Summit Lake	Any	23	Sold - Oct	264	55,634	0.28	PI 75 S 15 F 06	CCR	G	MPB
A64135	5	Rayfield River	Any	20	Sold - Dec	249	41,447	0.27	PI 88 S 12 At 01	CCR	G	MPB
A69934	1	Watch Lk	Any	9	Sold - Nov	37	4,427	0.26	PI 77 S 19 At 02	CCR	G	MPB
A69944	4	Raspberry Lake	Any	22	Sold - Dec	457	87,258	0.25	PI. S, (volume estimate)	CCR	G	MPB
A51954	2	Windy Mnt	Any	13	Sold - Oct	36	13,189	0.30	PI 82 B 11 S 06	CCR	G/C	MPB
A51960	3	Windy Creek	Any	24	Sold - Mar	128	33,636	0.28	PI 83 S 10, Ba 07	CCR	G	MPB
A51957	4	Jim Lake	2	24	Sold - Mar	153	19,682	0.23	PI 83 S 14, F 02	CCR	G	MPB
A61166	3	Graham Creek	Any	24	Sold - Feb	243	51,560	0.28	PI 96 S 04	CCR	G	MPB
A69933	3	Bowers South and Needa South	Any	24	Sold - Mar	109	25,505	0.34	PI 85 S 12 Ac 02	CCR	G	MPB
A42473	1	Bradley Ck	Any	8	Sold - Feb		956		PI. S, (volume estimate)	CCR	G	Decked R/W wood
Sub-total for 100 Mile House Field Team						1,942	416,115					
Grand Totals for the Kamloops Business Area						8,676	2,536,937					

Notes:

1. This schedule is "subject to change" and clients are encouraged to check it on a periodic basis.
2. Total Sale Volume - Cruise volume or if estimated, species column will state not cruised.
3. Silviculture System Codes: Clearcut (CC), Clearcut with reserves (CCR) & Retention (R)
4. Yarding System Codes: Ground (G), Cable (C), Helicopter (H), Horse (Ho) & Other (O)

The Sales Schedule can be accessed at the following website: http://www.for.gov.bc.ca/ftp/tka/external!/publish/sales_schedule/