

**BC Timber Sales, Kamloops Business Area  
Sales Schedule for April 1, 2006 to March 31, 2007**

TSL Number	# Blocks	Geographic Location	Category	Term (months)	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m <sup>3</sup> )	Avg Piece Size (m <sup>3</sup> per tree)	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
<b>CASCADES</b>												
<b>MERRITT</b>												
A75872	3	Wolfe-Belgie	Any	12	Sold - Jul	54	21,122	0.46	PI92,S8,(Fd)	CCR	G	MPB
A77083	4	Quilchena	Any	12	Sold - Jun	91	19,889	0.21	PI88,Fd10,S1	CCR	G	MPB
A75828	2	Elusive	Any	17	Sold - Jul	190	54,567	0.30	PI95,S3,B2,(Fd)	CCR	G/C	MPB
A81126	5	Pennask	Any	12	No Bid Aug	148	55,799	0.29	PI93,S7	CCR	G	MPB (previously A42303)
A81163	5	Pennask	Any	12	Sold - Sep	60	21,079	0.29	Not Cruised PI93,S7	CCR	G	MPB
A75710	1	Railroad	2	12	No Bid Sep	49	19,925	0.70	PI36,B30,S20,Fd10,(Pw,C,H)	CCR	C/G	MPB
A78676	1	Champion	Any	12	No Bid Sep	7	2,558	0.73	PI67,Fd25,S7	CCR	G	MPB
A78965	1	Pike Mtn	Any	12	Sold - Dec	93	33,537	0.42	PI60,Fd20,S20	CCR	G	MPB
A81126	7	Pennask	Any	19	Sold - Nov	152	49,815	0.29	PI93,S7	CCR	G	MPB (to be readvertised with Bk 1 removed)
A81484	1	Pennask	Any	12	Sold - Dec	14	6,064	0.29	PI93,S7	CCR	G	MPB (previously A81126 Bk 1)
A75710	1	Railroad/Champion	Any	12	No Bid Dec	56	22,074	0.70	PI40,BI30,Sx20,Fd10(Pw,C,H)(Not compl	CCR	C/G	MPB (previously A75710 & A78676 updated spec/piece est)
A79552	2	Dardenelles	2	12	Sold - Dec	115	33,208	0.35	PI60,S20,Fd20	CCR	G	MPB
A79550	1	Dardenelles	Any	24	Sold - Mar	200	72,517	0.35	PI80,Fd10,S10	CCR	G	MPB
A79594	2	Dardenelles	Any	24	Sold - Mar	251	68,911	0.29	PI60,S20,Fd20	CCR	G	MPB
A80355	2	Mystery Lake	Any	24	Sold - Mar	40	5,227	0.35	Not Cruised PI40,Fd20,S30	CCR	G	MPB
A79596	3	Dardenelles	Any	18	Sold - Mar	136	42,390	0.42	PI60,S30,Fd10	CCR	G	MPB
A75710	1	Railroad/Champion	Any	12	Sold - Mar	56	22,074	0.70	PI40,BI30,Sx20,Fd10(Pw,C,H)(N	CCR	C/G	MPB (previously A75710 & A78676 updated spec/piece est)
<b>LILLOOET</b>												
A77839	4	French Bar Creek	Any	36	No Bid Sep	257	33,083	0.15	PI86,S13,(Fd)	CCR	G	MPB
A78666		Cadwallader	Any	6	Sold - Aug		2,261	0.46	PI62,S22,B10,Fd6			Road ROW Decked Wood
<b>Sub-total for Cascades Field Team</b>						<b>1,969</b>	<b>586,100</b>					
<b>CLEARWATER</b>												
A80416	NA	McMurphy	Any	5	Sold - Jun	NA	3,060		Not Cruised Fd,Hw	CC	G	Decked wood TSM rates
A80415	NA	West Mahood	Any	5	Sold - Jul	NA	8,291		Not Cruised Fd,Sx,PI	CC	G	Decked wood TSM rates
A79075	1	Mahood Maury	Any	18	Sold - Sep	62	27,140	0.43	Cruised PI,Fd,(CS)	CCR	G	MPB
A79074	1	Mahood Maury	Any	18	Sold - Oct	69	24,339	0.32	PI60,Fd40	CCR	G	MPB
A80418	2	David Lake	2	12	No Bid Dec	53	17,621	0.76	PI80,Fd20	CCR	G	MPB-TFL 18
A60224	5	Mahood Aqua	Any	15	Sold - Dec	117	28,688		PI70,Fd20(CS)	CCR	G	MPB
A79076	1	Mahood Maury	2	15	Sold - Dec	61	25,744		PI70,S20(FdB)	CCR	G	MPB
A33275	5	SW Eakin FSR	Any	15	Sold - Dec	138	35,808		PI	CCR	G	MPB, Eakin Creek
A80419	2	West Mahood	2	15	Sold - Dec	84	23,413	0.49	PI80(SBF)	CCR	G	MPB 64M/64L
A80420	2	West Mahood	Any	15	Sold - Dec	46	16,282	0.37	PI80(SBF)	CCR	G	MPB 64N/64P
A81424	NA	West Mahood	Any	4	Sold - Oct	NA	1,740		Not Cruised (Fd,Cw,PI)	CC	G	Decked wood TSM rates
A81425	2	Mica Lake	Any	12	Sold - Jan	33	9,682	0.32	PI50,Fd17,Pw15,Ce11,Sx5	CCR	G	MPB
A75065	1	McMurphy	Any	12	Sold - Mar	40	22,603	0.47	PI60,S20,Fd10,B10	CCR	G/C	MPB
A54240	1	Jackpine Lake	Any	15	Sold - Feb	28	6,845	0.24	PI(Sx)	CCR	G	MPB, Eakin Creek
A54241	1	Mink Lake	Any	15	No Bid Mar	89	22,146	0.23	PI(Sx)	CCR	G	MPB, Eakin Creek
A80418	2	David Lake	Any	12	Sold - Jan	53	17,621	0.76	PI80,Fd20	CCR	G	MPB-TFL 18 readvertised
<b>Sub-total for Clearwater Field Team</b>						<b>872</b>	<b>291,023</b>					

**BC Timber Sales, Kamloops Business Area  
Sales Schedule for April 1, 2006 to March 31, 2007**

TSL Number	# Blocks	Geographic Location	Category	Term (months)	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m <sup>3</sup> )	Avg Piece Size (m <sup>3</sup> per tree)	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
<b>KAMLOOPS</b>												
A78090	2	Georges Creek East	2	12	Sold - Jun	95	42,171	0.40	PI92,Sx6,Ba2	CCR	G	MPB
A77722	1	Tranquille Lake	Any	12	Sold - Jun	143	34,381	0.22	PI94,Sx4,Ba1,Fd1	CCR	G	MPB
A77723	2	Tranquille Lake	Any	12	Sold - Jun	162	45,344	0.28	PI85,Ba10,Sx5	CCR	G	MPB
A78837	4	Bonaparte West	Any	12	Sold - Sep	81	22,503	0.24	PI96,Sx3,Ba1	CCR	G	MPB
A78839	2	Bonaparte West	Any	12	Sold - Sep	163	39,314	0.20	PI87,Sx8,Fd4,Ba1	CCR	G	MPB
A78091	1	Georges Creek East	Any	12	Sold - Aug	129	42,804	0.33	PI87,Sx8,Ba4,Fd1	CCR	G	MPB
A78093	1	Georges Creek East	Any	12	Sold - Jul	116	39,954	0.34	PI95,Fd3,Sp2	CCR	G	MPB
A79018	3	Georges creek South	Any	12	Sold - Sep	152	53,813	0.29	PI86Sx8Ba4Fd2	CCR	G	MPB
A79019	3	Georges creek South	Any	15	Sold - Nov	150	61,523	0.46	PI82,Sx10,Ba4,Fd4	CCR	G	MPB
A79861	2	Roche Lake	2	15	Sold - Nov	97	26,432	0.32	PI82,Sx11,Fd7	CCR	G	MPB
A78654	2	Georges creek South	Any	12	Sold - Oct	135	56,376	0.31	PI84,Sx12,Ba4	CCR	G	MPB
A79898	6	Haybrook	2	6	Sold - Dec	34	15,958	0.30	PI61,Fd27,Sp12	CC	G	MPB, small fir patches
<b>Sub-total for Kamloops Field Team</b>						<b>1,457</b>	<b>480,573</b>					
<b>100 MILE HOUSE</b>												
A59120	2	Hihium (273, 278)	Any	18	Sold - Jun	65	19,746	0.30	PI95,S5	CCR	G	
A69932	2	2 Mile (828, 889)	Any	12	Sold - Jun	31	8,872	0.48	PI59,S32,Fd7,Ba2	CCR	G	
A49143	1	Spanish Bdy(061)	2	18	Sold - Jun	29	14,049	0.61	S35,PI30,Fd18,Cw10,Ba3,He1,At3	CCR	G	
A69943	1	Timothy (600)	2	12	No Bid Sep	11	1,772	0.43	PI92,Fd4,S2,At2	CCR	G	winter harvesting with landing
A61146	3	Brigade (320, 849, 874)	Any	12	Sold - Aug	98	12,395	0.28	PI90,S8,Fd2	CCR	G	
A59115	2	Tuleric (603, 604)	2	18	Sold - Sep	66	14,290	0.37	PI93,S7	CCR	G	
A51923	1	Begbie (573)	Any	12	Sold - Sep	36	5,435	0.29	PI54,Fd45,S1	CCR	G	
A69943	1	Timothy (600)	Any	6	Sold - Oct	11	1,772	0.41	PI93,Fd4,S3	CCR	G	winter harvesting with landing
A74896	1	Boas (605)	Any	18	Sold - Oct	128	35,111	0.43	PI91,Fd9	CCR	G	
A55460	2	Oie Lake (575, 576)	2	18	Sold - Oct	28	8,301	0.77	Fd45,PI35,S15,Ba5	CCR	G	
A73219	6	Greenlee Lake (850, 852, 853, 854)	Any	24	Sold - Dec	214	41,068	0.37	PI45,Fd29,S13,Ce7,Ba6	CCR	G	
A69938	1	Boas (611)	Any	24	Sold - Nov	167	39,035	0.57	PI82,S10,Fd4,Ba4	CCR	G	
A55465	1	Oie Lake ( 577)	2	18	Sold - Dec	40	10,043	0.59	S61,PI35,Fd3,Ba1	CCR	G	
A51924	3	Spanish Bdy( 102, 103, 154)	2	12	Sold - Dec	17	6,483	0.83	S69,Ba13,PI4,Fd11,Cw1,He2	CCR	G	
A69979	5	Rayfield (842) Price Cr (914-917)	Any	18	Sold - Dec		43,755		vol estimate, not compiled	CCR	G	
A59126	5	Bobbs Lk (858-1, 2, 859-1, 2, 860)	Any	18	Sold - Mar	66	15,353	0.37	PI71,Fd20,S7,Ba2	CCR	G	
A61153	1	Bonaparte (935)	Any	14	Sold - Mar	22	2,580	0.70	Not Cruised At50,S30,PI20	CCR	G	winter only
<b>Sub-total for 100 Mile House Field Team</b>						<b>1,029</b>	<b>280,060</b>					
<b>Grand Totals for the Kamloops Business Area</b>						<b>5,327</b>	<b>1,637,756</b>					

**Notes:**

1. This schedule is "subject to change" and clients are encouraged to check it on a periodic basis.
2. Total Sale Volume - Cruise volume or if estimated, species column will state not cruised.
3. Silviculture System Codes: Clearcut (CC), Clearcut with reserves (CCR) & Retention (R)
4. Yarding System Codes: Ground (G), Cable (C), Helicopter (H), Horse (Ho) & Other (O)

The Sales Schedule can be accessed at the following website: [http://www.for.gov.bc.ca/ftp/tka/external!/publish/sales\\_schedule/](http://www.for.gov.bc.ca/ftp/tka/external!/publish/sales_schedule/)