

BC Timber Sales - Kamloops Business Area

Sales Schedule for April 1, 2004 - March 31, 2005

TSL Number	# Blks	Geographic Location	Category	Term	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m³)	Avg Piece Size	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
CASCADES												
MERRITT												
A74310	5	Ketchan	Any	5 mos	Sold - Sep 23/04	55.0	13,286	0.40	* PI(FdS)	CCR	Skidder	MPB
A72882		Garrison	Any	4 mos	Sold - Jun 14/04	12.0	5,082	0.66	* S(PI)			Decked Wood
A71738		Laura Lakes	Any	24 mos	Sold - Oct 18/04	126.0	21,520	0.22	* PI(SFd)	CCR	Skidder	
A74389		Laura Lakes	2	24 mos	Sold - Oct 26/04	100.0	25,047	0.22	* PI(SFd)	CCR	Skidder	
FLTC A71550	R/W	Champion (Rd)	Any	5 mos	Sold - Sep 09/04	15.0	841	0.69	* PI(Fd)			Road R/W
A71739		Laura Lakes	Any	24 mos	Sold - Nov 29/04	84.0	20,966	0.18	* PI(SFd)	CCR	Skidder	
A74369	1	Rabbitt	Any	6 mos	Sold - Dec 16/04	5.0	2,327	0.38	* PI(FdS)	CCR	Skidder	MPB
A69738	4+Ex	Sunday Summit	Any	19 mos	Sold - Jan 13/05	87.0	32,745	0.30	* PI(S)			MPB
A72881	2	Elusive	2	9 mos	Q4 Jan - Mar	57.0	13,000	0.39	* PI	CC	Cable	MPB
A72879	2	Garrison	Any	9 mos	Sold - Mar 31/05	55.0	9,756	0.25	* PI(Fd)	CC	Cable	MPB
A72876	2+Ex	Wolfe-Belgie	2	9 mos	Q4 Jan - Mar	43.0	11,500	0.25	* PI(FdS)	CC	Skidder/Cable	MPB
A76158	1	Dardenelles Lake	Any	6 mos	Sold - Mar 10/05	69.9	17,461	0.24	PI(S)	CC Res	Skidder	MPB
A75563	1	Otter Vally Rd 15 KM	Any	6 mos	Sold - Mar 11/05	19.9	4,533	0.49	PI(Py)	CC Res	Skidder	MPB
LILLOOET												
A71737	5	No-Axe Liza	Any	24 mos	Sold - Jul 05/04	78.1	24,562	0.18	* PI87S9B4	CCR	Skidder	
A75151		Goldbridge	Any		No Bid Aug 23		535					Decked Wood
A75151		Goldbridge	Any		No Bid Sep 20		535					Decked Wood
A60829	3	Tommy Creek	Any	48 mos	Sold - Feb 24/05	242.3	69,952	0.52	* FdS(PI)	CC & select	cable	need to field review TSFA issues
A71307	2	Murray Creek	Any	12 mos	Sold - Mar 24/05	38.0	8,252	0.34	PI(Fd, SX)	CCR	Skidder	MPB
A74375	3	Frenchbar Creek	Any	24 mos	Q4 Jan - Mar	24.0	5,000	0.20	* PI(S)	CC	Skidder	MPB
A74819	1	Tom Cole	Any	7 mos	Q4 Jan - Mar	30.0	13,500	0.35	* PI(FdS)	CCR	Skidder	Some MPB
Sub-total for Cascades Field Team						1,141.2	300,400					
Cascades Sum Category Any							250,853					
Cascades Sum Category 2							49,547					
Merritt Total							178,064					
Merritt Cat Any							128,517		Remaining to be Sold:			-
Merritt Cat 2							49,547		Remaining to be Sold:			24,500
Lillooet Total							122,336					
Lillooet Any							122,336		Remaining to be Sold:			18,500
Lillooet Cat 2							-					
CLEARWATER												
A72908	1	Salle Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Jun 30/04	24.0	6,611	0.54	FDI5PLI56BI18Sx16	CC	Ground	McClure Fire Salvage
A74385	2	Nehalliston	2	9 mos	Sold - Oct 28/04	40.0	16,737	0.69	* PL78/Sx17/FD3	CCR	Grd/Cable	MPB-Baited remove by 05/08/01
A74943	2	Tawee	2	10 mos	Sold - Oct 20/04	85.0	26,019	0.57	* PL	CCR	Ground	MPB-remove by 05/08/01
A72404	6	Darlington	2	9 mos	Sold - Dec 13/04	140.0	44,617	0.59	* PL52/SX29/BL12/FD5	CC	Ground	MPB-Baited remove by 05/08/01
A71702	1	S. Dudgeon/ Harbour	2	9 mos	Sold - Nov 18/04	50.4	6,638	0.61	Pw60PI25Fd15	Select	Skidder	Mtn Pine Beetle and blister rust salvage, Bait and sell, RW comes with block
A56780	6	Adolph	Any	24 mos	No Bid Jan 11	79.2	21,525	0.80	BI48Sx45Cw7	CCR	Grd/Cable	Resale of A56799 Oct/Nov Harvest
A72335	2	Boundary Lake	Any	10 mos	Sold - Feb 24/05	11.2	5,848	0.41	PII66FdI22Sx11BI1	CC	Skidder	Blowdown salvage
A72866	1	Avola Fire	Any	9 mos	Sold - Jan 14/05	11.2	3,241	0.69	* PI51/FD30/Cw10	CCR	Ground	Salvage and RW wood for access to A60233
A75878	1	Demo Forest	Any	9 mos	Sold - Feb 11/05	14.3	4,548	0.50	PII51FdI40Ep3Cw3Sx3	CC	Ground	MPB bait remove before July 2005
A74500	2	West Mahood	Any	24 mos	Sold - Mar 10/05	188.0	35,452		Sx60BI40	CCR	Grd/Cable	SBB salv rework A66918 harvest 2 passes
A75449	1	West Mahood	Any	24 mos	Sold - Mar 17/05	78.6	21,167	0.52	Sx70BI28/PII2	CCR	Grd/Cable	SBB salvage, harvest 2 passes
A74501	6	David Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Mar 24/05	98.3	29,474	0.32	* PI170Sx21Fdi5BI4	CCR	Skidder/ Cable	MPB bait remove before July 2005
A76772	2	David Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Mar 31/05	52.0	15,971	0.37	PII67Sx21BI9FdI3	CCR	Ground	Originally in TSL A74501
A76773	2	David Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Mar 21/05	33.2	8,470	0.36	PII61Sx27BI12FdI1	CCR	Ground	Originally in TSL A74501
FLTC	R/W	West Mahood Mainline	Any	4 mos	Sold - Feb 14/05	6.0	1,264		* FDI/SvPLI	CC	Ground	Mainline RW use as trap decks
Sub-total for Clearwater Field Team						911.4	247,582					
Sum Category "ANY"							153,571		Remaining to be Sold:			21,525
Sum Category 2							94,011		Remaining to be Sold:			-
KAMLOOPS												
A70427	2	Tranquille	Any	3 mos	Sold - Apr 27/04	51.8	16,184	0.32	PI85/Sx11/BI14	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73605	5	Mow Creek	Any	3 mos	Sold - Jun 01/04	80.4	23,580		* PI90/Sx10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73610	7	Chuwels Mtn	Any	3 mos	Sold - Jun 29/04	71.0	20,006		* PI90/Fd10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73606	3	Sylvester Creek	Any	3 mos	Sold - Jun 28/04	166.5	50,659		* PI90/Fd10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73607	3	Sylvester Creek	2	3 mos	Sold - Jun 30/04	97.8	21,156		* PI90/Fd5/Sx5	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A68743	2	Salle Lake/Peterson Creek	Any	6 mos	Sold - Jun 14/04	32.0	8,441		* PI70/BI15/Sx15	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73604	7	Haggard Creek	Any	9 mos	Sold - Oct 22/04	92.8	23,472	0.42	* PI51/Fd35/Sx9	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A74456	3	Mow Creek	2	9 mos	Sold - Oct 15/04	69.8	17,434		* PI90/Sx10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A75254	2	Roche Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Oct 29/04	120.0	33,626	0.40	* PI50/Fd50	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
FLTC A75397	R/W	Highland Valley/Woods Ck	Any	6 mos	Sold - Sep 23/04	7.4 km	1,820		* PI90/Sx10			Road R/W
FLTC A75152	R/W	Mow Creek North	Any	6 mos	Sold - Sep 29/04	4.5 km	1,350		* PI90/Sx10			Road R/W
A75253	3	Roche Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Nov 5/04	124.0	29,797	0.43	Fd70/PI30	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A75255	2	Roche Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Nov 19/04	48.0	11,570	0.38	PI50/Fd50	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A74641	1	Roche Lake	2	6 mos	Sold - Nov 26/04	72.9	20,123	0.32	PI64/Fd22/Sx14	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73603	7	Ross Moore Lake	2	6 mos	No Bid Dec 09/04	22.1	3,454		* PI60/Sx20/Fd20	CC/CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73609	1	Highland Valley	2	6 mos	No Bid Dec 10/04	46.4	7,681	0.20	PI99/Fd1	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A75216	4	Allan Lake	2	9 mos	Sold - Dec 09/04	30.4	6,368		* PI60/B30/Sx10	CC	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73603	7	Ross Moore Lake	Any	6 mos	Sold - Jan 05/05	22.1	3,454		* PI60/Sx20/Fd20	CC/CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A73609	1	Highland Valley	Any	6 mos	Sold - Jan 06/05	46.4	7,681	0.20	PI99/Fd1	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A75217	4	Mow Creek	Any	6 mos	No Bid Jan 10/05	122.2	37,669		* PI95/Sx5	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A75841	6	Peterson Creek	Any	14 mos	Sold - Mar 03/05	149.1	42,163		* PI80/Sx10/BI10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A75217	4	Mow Creek	Any	1 Yr	Sold - Feb 25/05	122.2	37,669		* PI95/Sx5	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A76605	5	McGillivray Lake	Any	6 mos	Sold - Mar 31/05	50.7	14,912		* PI70/Fd10/Sx10/BI10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A76606	1	McGillivray Lake	Any	1 Yr	Q4 Jan - Mar	101.3	30,390		* PI70/Fd10/Sx10/BI10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
A76608	3	McGillivray Lake	Any	1 Yr	Q4 Jan - Mar	82.3	23,957		* PI70/Fd10/Sx10/BI10	CCRRes	skidder	Mountain Pine Beetle
Sub-total for Kamloops Field Team						1,822.2	494,616					
Sum Category "ANY"							418,400		Remaining to be Sold:			54,347
Sum Category 2							76,216		Remaining to be Sold:			-
100 MILE HOUSE												
A73215		Boas Creek	ANY		Sold - Apr 13/04		4,850					
A73667	1	Bonaparte Lake S	ANY	5 months	Sold - Jun 01/04		7,190					Decked wood - Fire Salvage
A73217	2	Twin Ck	ANY	1 yr	Sold - Apr 27/04	55.5	4,129	0.2	PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A71593	2	Chris & Alans Lk	2	1 yr	Sold - Jul 14/04		9,472		PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A73218	1	Bosk Lk	2	1 yr	Sold - Nov 04/04		16,705		SB	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74884	2	Twin Ck	ANY	1 yr	Sold - Aug 26/04	14.4	1,592		PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A59140	1	Burrit Ck Rd -177	Any	1 yr	Sold - Oct 26/04	62.5	17,435		* SB			
A59142	1	Streak Lake	Any	9 mos	Sold - Oct 18/04	15.9	2,935		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A73214	8	Chartrand Lk (436-440, 432, 875, 123)	Any	1 yr	No Bid Nov 18/04		37,727		PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight (37727 m3)
A74893	2	Pidgeon Ck (531,532,533)	Any	8 mos	No Bid Nov 19/04	100.0	8,956		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74690	1	Weller Lk (377)	2	10 mos	Sold - Dec 02/04	38.0	10,338		* SPI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74885	7	Burrit Creek BD (503,505-509)	Any	12 mos	Sold - Dec 17/04	103.6	32,326		* SB	ccres	Ground	Blowdown & Beetle- remove by next flight
A74886	2	Gotchen BD (510,511,512)	2	1 yr	Sold - Jan 10/05	56.8	17,629		SB	ccres	Ground	Blowdown & Beetle- remove by next flight
A73214	8	Chartrand Lk (436-440, 432, 875, 123)	Any	1 yr	Sold - Jan 13/05		37,727		PI	ccres	Ground	
A74893	2	Pidgeon Ck (531,532,533)	Any	7 mos	Sold - Jan 06/05	100.1	8,956		* PI	ccres	Ground	
A74887	2	Peach Lake (513,829)	Any	15 mos	Sold - Mar 31/05	60.4	18,729		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74889	10	Rail Lk (448,515-518,540,541,555-557)	Any	18 mos	Sold - Jan 17/05	257.0	72,548		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A75487	Decks	Various- 100 Mile TSA	Any	7 mos	No Bid Mar 03/05	n/a	3,269		* Various	Decks	Ground	Decked right-of-way wood only
A61156	2	Fawn Lk (835,329)	Any	7 mos	Sold - Jan 27/05	58.0	13,618		PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74888	1	Attwood Cr.	Any	5 mos	Sold - Jan 19/05	29.5	6,003		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74892	3	Gwenie Lk S (525,526,527)	Any	1 yr	Sold - Mar 01/05	30.0	7,952		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
A74894	1	Kellington Lake (535)	2	5 mos	Sold - Feb 10/05	38.0	16,044		* PI	ccres	Ground	Beetle- remove by next flight
Sub-total for 100 Mile House Field Team							356,130					