

**BC Timber Sales, Kamloops Business Area
Sales Schedule for April 1, 2007 to March 31, 2008**

TSL Number	# Blocks	Geographic Location	Category	Term (months)	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m³)	Avg Piece Size (m³ per tree)	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
CASCADES												
MERRITT												
A79595	1	Dardenelles	Any	24	Sold - Jun	190	60,627	0.30	PI 80,S16,Fd4	CCR	G	MPB
A80473	6	Dardenelles	Any	24	Sold - Jun	281	94,602	0.33	PI 83,S12,Fd3,BI2	CCR	G	MPB
A80475	4	Dardenelles	Any	24	Sold - Jun	310	85,325	0.25	PI79,S14,Fd6	CCR	G	MPB
A79593	1	Dardenelles	Any	12	Sold - May	35	11,443	0.36	PI87,S10,Fd03	CCR	G	MPB
A81923	1	Dardenelles	2	18	Sold - Jun	68	24,110	0.44	PI69,S20,Fd8,BI2	CCR	G	MPB
A80474	2	Dardenelles	2	18	Sold - Aug	81	22,404	0.28	PI82,S13,Fd4	CCR	G	MPB
A75794	3	Rabbitt Mtn	2	18	No Bid Sep	69	19,054	0.55	Fd47,PI41,S8,BI2,Py2	CCR	G	MPB
A75161	2	Galena	Any	18	Sold - Aug	112	40,242	0.23	PI86,Fd06,BI04,Sx04	CCR	G	MPB
A80203	1	Maka Creek	Any	18	No Bid Sep	48	8,050	0.29	PI73,Fd21,Sx4	CCR	G	MPB
A82866	1	TeePee - Decked Wood Sale	Any	12	No Bid Sep		814		PI-not cruised			MPB
A82866	1	TeePee - Decked Wood Sale	Any	12	Sold - Oct		814		PI-not cruised			MPB
A42348	5	Tyner lake	Any	24	No Bid Dec	171	39,470	0.23	PI93,S6,(BI, Fd)	CCR	G	MPB
A81531	1	Mathew/McPhail Creek	Any	18	No Bid Dec	157	25,187	0.22	PI83,Fd8,S7,BI2	CCR	G	MPB
A75794	3	Rabbitt Mtn	Any	18	No Bid Oct	69	19,054	0.55	Fd47,PI41,S8,BI2,Py2	CCR	G	MPB
A42348	5	Tyner lake	Any	24	Sold - Feb	171	39,470	0.23	PI93,S6,(BI, Fd)	CCR	G	MPB
A81531	1	Mathew/McPhail Creek	Any	18	No Bid Feb	157	25,187	0.22	PI83,Fd8,S7,BI2	CCR	G	MPB
A80203	1	Maka Creek	Any	18	Sold - Mar	48	8,050	0.29	PI73,Fd21,Sx4	CCR	G	MPB
LILLOOET												
A82375	2	Milk Ranch	Any	18	Sold - Aug	61	19,913	0.45	Sx52,PI38,Fd9,B1	CCR	G	MPB
A80040	3	Tom Cole	2	18	No Bid Sep	67	16,930	0.39	PI80, S10, Fd10	CCR	G	MPB
A80040	3	Tom Cole	Any	18	No Bid Oct	67	16,930	0.23	PI80, S10, Fd10	CCR	G	MPB
A80368	3	Nicoamen	Any	18	No Bid Dec	65	19,413	0.30	PI51,Fd27,BI13,Sx9	CCR	G	MPB
A80040	3	Tom Cole	Any	24	No Bid Nov	67	16,930	0.23	PI80, S10, Fd10	CCR	G	MPB
A80961	2	McGillivray	Any	26	No Bid Mar	66	20,002	0.35	PI78,Fd10,S10,BI2	CCR	G/C	MPB
A82374	4	Murray	Any	26	No Bid Mar	51	11,394	0.35	PI80,Fd16,S2,BI2	CCR	G	MPB
Sub-total for Cascades Field Team						2,410	645,415					
CLEARWATER												
A54241	1	Mink Lake	Any	15	Sold - Jun	89	22,146	0.23	PI(Sx)	CCR	G	MPB, Eakin Creek
A78990	2	Bonaparte Lake	Any	12	No Bid May	140	40,433	0.21	PI9S1	CCR	G	MPB
A78990	2	Bonaparte Lake	Any	12	Sold - Jun	140	40,433	0.21	PI9S1	CCR	G	MPB
A78992	1	Bonaparte Lake	Any	12	No Bid May	128	31,921	0.23	PI10	CCR	G	MPB
A78992	1	Bonaparte Lake	Any	12	Sold - Jun	128	31,921	0.23	PI10	CCR	G	MPB
A81593	1	Mahood Maury	Any	12	Sold - Jun	65	21,032	0.34	PI6FD2(CBS)2	CCR	G	MPB
A81552	2	Bonaparte Lake	Any	15	Sold - Aug	32	10,016	0.31	PI8(SB)2	CCR	G	MPB
A81809	1	Nomans Lk.	Any	15	Sold - Aug	80	22,196	0.40	PI90,SBF10	CCR	G	MPB
A60950	3	Nomans Lk.	Any	15	Sold - Oct	71	27,367	0.40	PI67,Sx33	CCR	G	MPB
A81588	2	Mahood Aqua	Any	15	No Bid Dec	56	21,236	0.46	PL6FD2(CHSB)2	CCR	G	MPB
A81591	2	Mahood Aqua	2	15	Sold - Dec	58	25,837	0.87	PL6FD2(SBCH)2	CCR	G	MPB
A60949	4	Trails End	Any	15	Sold - Oct	108	32,681	0.45	PI70,S20,(BF)10	CC	G	MPB
A54237	3	Nomans Lk.	Any	15	Sold - Dec	75	25,404	0.40	PI60,(SBF)40	CCR	G	MPB
A81588	2	Mahood Aqua	Any	15	Sold - Dec	56	21,236	0.46	PL6FD2(CHSB)2	CCR	G	MPB
Sub-total for Clearwater Field Team						1,226	373,859					

**BC Timber Sales, Kamloops Business Area
Sales Schedule for April 1, 2007 to March 31, 2008**

TSL Number	# Blocks	Geographic Location	Category	Term (months)	Estimated Sale Date	Net Area (ha)	Total Sale Volume (m ³)	Avg Piece Size (m ³ per tree)	Species Composition	Silviculture System	Yarding System	Harvest Considerations
KAMLOOPS												
A78838	2	Bonaparte Lake	Any	15	Sold - Apr	151	31,243	0.16	PI97,S2,Ba1	CCRES	G	MPB
A78881	2	Georges Creek	2	15	Sold - Apr	105	39,788	0.27	PI91,S7,Ba2	CCRES	G	MPB
A78989	1	Bonaparte Lake	Any	15	Sold - Apr	98	27,091	0.24	PI95,S4,Ba1	CCRES	G	MPB
A80043	2	Roche Lake	2	15	Sold - Apr	113	29,851	0.28	PI87,S7,Fd5,At1	CCRES	G	MPB
A80688	1	Roche Lake	Any	18	Sold - Aug	199	78,384	0.33	PI89,S5,Fd5,Ba1	CCRES	G	MPB
A80689	1	Roche Lake	Any	15	Sold - Aug	137	39,529	0.40	PI90,S7,Fd3	CCRES	G	MPB
A81551	2	Roche Lake	2	12	Sold - Sep	47	18,461	0.45	PI77,Fd13,S8,Ba2	CCRES	G	MPB
A79859	3	Lac Le Jeune North	Any	15	Sold - Jul	143	46,760	0.32	PI89,S8,Fd3	CCRES	G	MPB
A79860	2	Roche Lake	Any	18	No Bid Sep	102	34,257	0.34	PI71,Fd18,S10,Ba1	CCRES	G	MPB Restricted to Sept-March harvest window
A82911	1	Georges Creek	Any	12	Sold - Sep	118	39,510		PI - not cruised	CCRES	G	MPB-resale of A78091 (partially logged, decked, F&B)
A79860	2	Roche Lake	Any	18	Sold - Dec	102	34,257		PI - cruise resweep	CCRES	G	MPB Restricted to Sept-March harvest window
A81311	2	Georges Creek	Any	18	Sold - Dec	289	105,131	0.26	PI84,S14,B2	CCRES	G	MPB
A81265	1	Roche Lake	Any	15	Sold - Jan	199	60,361	0.30	PI92,S5,B3	CCRES	G	MPB
A83333	1	Robertson Creek	Any	15	Sold - Jan	83	16,964	0.30	PI87,S6,Fd4,Ba3	CCRES	G	MPB
A83331	1	Robertson Creek	Any	24	Sold - Jan	160	38,304	0.30	PI79,S13,Fd7,Ba1	CCRES	G	MPB
A83872	2	Georges/Roche/Bulman	2	18	Sold - Mar	64	21,718	0.40	PI86,S8,Fd4	CCRES	G	MPB
Sub-total for Kamloops Field Team						2,110	661,609					
100 MILE HOUSE												
A59136	3	ArchieMdw,ForbesCk,Bearpaw	Any	12	Sold - Jun	71	8,583	0.39	PI82,S15,F3-PL85,F9,S6	CCR	G	Landing only on both CPs
A69940	1	Hooligan Lake	Any	12	Sold - May	51	10,944	0.20	PI88,S12,	CCR	G	
A59135	3	Eagan,Wavey,French Lks	Any	12	Sold - Jun	56	13,366	0.46	PI82,S18-PI90,S9,Ba1-PI98,S2	CCR	G	
A59143	5	Peel Lk	Any	18	Sold - Jun	230	51,178	0.35	PI65,S30,F2	CCR	G	
A61149	1	Brigade	Any	12	No Bid Sep	27	2,766	0.14	PI95,F3,S2	CCR	G	
A59150	2	Doman	2	14	No Bid Sep	62	12,027		PI - Not Cruised	CCR	G	
A59151	1	Graham Creek	2	18	Sold - Oct	99	18,290	0.31	PI94,S6	CCR	G	
A69946	3	Jim Creek	Any	14	Sold - Oct	127	32,494	0.24	PI76,S11,F12	CCR	G	
A59150	2	Doman	Any	14	Sold - Oct	62	12,027	0.27	PI76,S24	CCR	G	
A61163	2	Graham Creek	Any	24	Sold - Nov	240	44,893	0.31	PI91,S9	CCR	G	
A61172	5	Green Lk	Any	18	Sold - Dec	167	17,233	0.22	PI99,FS1	CCR	G	
A61157	1	Elbow Lk	Any	16	Sold - Dec	151	37,393	0.31	PI82,S17,FBa1	CCR	G	
A69947	2	Begbie	Any	14	Sold - Jan	64	9,294	0.26	PI - Not Cruised	CCR	G	
A69941	6	Jim Lake	Any	18	Sold - Feb	282	45,760	0.27	PI88,F6,S6	CCR	G	Blocks HH901 and MH903 landings only
A69942	8	Blue Goose, Pressy Lk	Any	24	Sold - Mar	454	64,741	0.27	PI78,S20,Fd1,At1	CCR	G	
A39890	1	Gotchen	Any	24	No Bid Mar	129	53,440	0.81	Fd35,S31,PI24,C6,Ba4	CCR	G	ground skid and Highlead cable, winter ground
A59132	1	Gotchen	2	24	Sold - Mar	123	49,112	0.81	S71,Ba14,Fd11,C4	CCR	G	ground skid and Highlead cable, winter ground
Sub-total for 100 Mile House Field Team						2,395	483,541					
Grand Totals for the Kamloops Business Area						8,141	2,164,424					

Notes:

1. This schedule is "subject to change" and clients are encouraged to check it on a periodic basis.
2. Total Sale Volume - Cruise volume or if estimated, species column will state not cruised.
3. Silviculture System Codes: Clearcut (CC), Clearcut with reserves (CCR) & Retention (R)
4. Yarding System Codes: Ground (G), Cable (C), Helicopter (H), Horse (Ho) & Other (O)

The Sales Schedule can be accessed at the following website: http://www.for.gov.bc.ca/ftp/tka/external!/publish/sales_schedule/